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Brady Client Services Launches Two New Services: Lockout Equipment Inventory 
Service and Annual Lockout Procedure Audits 

Expanded lockout services provide support for companies during their lockout journey 
 

MILWAUKEE, Wis. (March 3, 2015) — Brady (NYSE:BRC), a global leader in industrial 
and safety printing systems and solutions, today announced that its Client Services group 
launched two new services:  Lockout Equipment Inventory Service and Annual Lockout 
Procedure Audits.  
 
“Our team is constantly working to meet and exceed the needs of our clients, and we are 
expanding our services with their lockout goals in mind,” says Tim Bandt, global director of 
Client Services for Brady. “Our new services offer additional guidance to assist our 
customers on their journey to reaching lockout tagout success and program sustainability.” 
 
The Lockout Equipment Inventory Service helps clients save both time and money by 
creating a detailed list of their equipment and machinery that requires lockout. Having an 
accurate and up-to-date lockout equipment list is an important step to creating effective 
lockout procedures. To complete this service, Brady comes onsite to collect data and create 
the equipment list with all relevant information. This spreadsheet can be easily imported into 
Brady’s LINK360® software to help create visual lockout procedures. 
 
Lockout procedure audits are required to be conducted annually under OSHA’s periodic 
inspection requirements, and best practice is to have a third party perform the audit who 
does not perform the lockout process routinely. To help align with this standard, Brady’s 
Annual Lockout Procedure Audits bring Brady onsite to verify that machinery and isolation 
points on the procedure are correct, document any deficiencies in the process and provide 
your company with documented proof of audit. All results will be provided in a report and 
incorporated into your LINK360 software program, if applicable.  
 
These two new services are an addition to Brady’s comprehensive line of lockout services, 
software and products, including Visual Lockout Procedure Writing, Lockout Tagout Safety 
Training, LINK360 software, and lockout devices, tags and printing systems. 
 
For more information: 
To learn more about Brady Client Services, visit BradyClientServices.com. For Brady’s 
complete product offering, visit BradyID.com. 
 
About Brady Corporation:  
Brady Corporation is an international manufacturer and marketer of complete solutions that 
identify and protect people, products and places. Brady’s products help customers increase 
safety, security, productivity and performance and include high-performance labels, signs, 
safety devices, printing systems and software. Founded in 1914, the company has a diverse 
customer base in electronics, telecommunications, manufacturing, electrical, construction, 
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education, medical, aerospace and a variety of other industries. Brady is headquartered in 
Milwaukee, Wisconsin and as of August 1, 2014, employed approximately 6,400 people in 
its worldwide businesses. Brady’s fiscal 2014 sales were approximately $1.23 billion. Brady 
stock trades on the New York Stock Exchange under the symbol BRC. More information is 
available on the Internet at www.bradycorp.com. 
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